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Contractor Name

Contract #0330 - Concrete

AMERICAN INDIAN

Saint Paul Public Schools - American Indian Magnet School MAGNET BEHSEL.

Bid Tabulation - March 26, 2020

Bid Bond
RCV Att A-1

Base Bid Total Bid

B and D Associates, LLC

Y|IY|Y 1,410,000.00 12,000.00 NA NA NA NA 1,422,000.00 NA NA NA NA NA NA

Ultra Concrete

YIY|Y 1,700,000.00 10,000.00 1,710,000.00

Maertens-Brenny Construction Company

Y|Y|Y| 1,970,000.00 | 45,000.00 NA NA NA NA 2,015,000.00 NA NA NA NA NA NA

Contract #0420 - Masonry

Maertens-Brenny Construction Company Y|Y|Y 899,000.00 NA NA NA NA NA 899,000.00 NA NA NA NA NA NA
Hollenback and Nelson, Inc. Y|N|N 925,800.00 NA NA NA NA NA 925,800.00 NA NA NA NA NA NA
B and D Associates, LLC Y|Y|Y 1,104,600.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,104,600.00 NA NA NA NA NA NA
John Foley Masonry Y|Y|Y 1,344,000.00 NA NA NA NA NA 1,344,000.00 NA NA NA NA NA NA
Contract #0510 - Steel Erection

Patriot Erectors, Inc. Y|Y|Y 646,500.00 NA NA NA NA NA 646,500.00 NA NA NA NA NA NA
High Five Erectors II, Inc. Y|Y|Y 708,500.00 4,000.00 NA NA NA NA 712,500.00 NA NA NA NA NA NA
Red Cedar Steel Erectors, Inc. N|N|[N 794,370.00 NA NA NA NA NA 794,370.00 NA NA NA NA NA NA

Contract #0512 - Structural Steel/Misc Metal Supply

Contract #0610 - General Construction/Selective Demo/Carpentry

Schreiber Mullaney Construction Y|[Y]Y 3,810,000.00 8,500.00 3,818,500.00
Maertens-Brenny Construction Company Y|Y]|Y 3,900,000.00 NA NA NA 20,000.00 NA 3,920,000.00 6.00 NA NA NA NA NA
Meisinger Construction Company, Inc. Y|Y]|Y 4,426,000.00 12,500.00 60,500.00 4,499,000.00
Construction Results Corporation Y|Y]|Y 5,109,720.00 25,000.00 5,134,720.00
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Bid Bond
RCV
RCV Att A-1

Contractor Name

Contract #0618 - Glued-Laminated Structural Units

Alamco Wood Products, LLC
DBA Bell Structural Soltions

Base Bid

287,083.00

Total Bid

287,083.00

Saint Paul Public Schools - American Indian Magnet School
Bid Tabulation - March 26, 2020

AMERICAN INDIAN
MAGNET SCHOOL

Timber Systems *MATERIAL ONLY BID*

Contract #0725 - Weather Barriers

Contract #0750 - Roofing/Sheet Metal/Metal Panels

Contract #0790 - Firestopping and Joint Sealers

WCS1, LLC,

Waumandee Creek Sealants, LLC Y|Y|Y|Y|Y|[N|N

168,000.00

1,500.00

169,500.00

NA

Carciofini Company N|IY[Y[Y|Y|Y]Y

Contract #0810 - Doors/Frames/Hardware - Supply

Kendell Door

298,560.00

433,958.00

NA

298,560.00

433,958.00

NA

NA

Twin City Hardware

Contract #0833 - Coiling and Sectional Doors

579,786.00

579,786.00

Contract #0840 - Aluminum Storefronts/Curtainwalls/Glass/Glazing

S & J Construction, Inc.

DBA S & ] Glass, Inc. Y| Y|Y|[Y]|]Y|[N|N 998,900.00 NA NA NA NA NA 998,900.00 NA NA NA NA NA NA
Northern Glass & Glazing, Inc. NIY[Y|Y|]Y|N|N 1,124,000.00 1,124,000.00

Envision Glass, Inc. Y| Y|Y|Y|Y|[Y]Y 1,238,244.00 - 1,238,244.00 - - - - - -
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AMERICAN INDIAN
MAGNET SCHOOL

Saint Paul Public Schools - American Indian Magnet School
Bid Tabulation - March 26, 2020

Contractor Name

Contract #0920 - Drywall and Fireproofing

RTL Construction, Inc.

Bid Bond

RCV Att A-1

Base Bid

2,609,000.00

Total Bid

2,609,000.00

Pinnacle Wall Systems

Contract #0930 - Tiling

3,640,000.00

3,640,000.00

Contract #0950 - Acoustical Ceilings and Panels

3.00 min
Grazzini Brothers and Company Y|Y|Y N N 498,500.00 498,500.00 | 1000 sf
Blackhawk Tile and Stone, Inc. Y|Y|Y Y N 599,640.00 599,640.00 5.50
Advance Terrazzo and Tile Co. Y|[Y|Y Y N 740,800.00 740,800.00 2.50

Contract #0966 - Athletic Flooring

SPEC Athletic, Inc.

108,913.70

108,913.70

Sonus Interiors, Inc. Y|Y|Y Y Y 1,199,900.00 NA NA NA NA NA 1,199,900.00

Architectural Sales of MN, Inc. Y|Y|Y Y N 1,223,500.00 NA NA NA NA NA 1,223,500.00 NA NA NA NA NA NA
Twin City Acoustics, Inc. Y|Y]|Y Y Y 1,264,800.00 1,264,800.00

Contract #0965 - Resilient Flooring and Carpet

Commercial Flooring Services, LLC Y[Y|Y Y Y 906,425.00 75,915.00 982,340.00 6.50

Sonus Interiors, Inc. Y|Y|Y Y Y 920,993.00 NA NA 142,000.00 NA NA 1,062,993.00 6.00 NA NA NA NA NA
Grazzini Brothers and Company N|N|[N N N 994,610.00 168,700.00 1,163,310.00 6.83

H2I Group

144,200.00

144,200.00

Hamernick Interior Solutions Y|Y|Y Y N 418,000.00 418,000.00

no dwg
Steinbrecher Painting, Inc. Y|Y]|Y Y N 481,100.00 1,615.00 NA NA NA NA 482,715.00 NA 0.95 0.95 0.95 A870 NA
Wasche Commercial Finishes N|Y|Y Y Y 579,690.00 2,930.00 NA NA NA NA 582,620.00 NA NA NA NA NA NA
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Contractor Name

Contract #1051 - Lockers

AMERICAN INDIAN

Saint Paul Public Schools - American Indian Magnet School MAGNET BEHSEL.

Bid Tabulation - March 26, 2020

Bid Bond
RCV Att A-1

Base Bid Total Bid

Wissota Supply Co., Inc. Y|Y|Y|[Y|N|N|N 136,000.00 136,000.00

Olympus Lockers and Storage

Products, Inc. Y|IY|Y|[Y|Y|]Y]|Y 148,781.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 148,781.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
H2I Group, Inc. Y[Y|[Y|[Y|Y|Y]|Y 168,891.00 NA NA NA NA NA 168,891.00 NA NA NA NA NA NA

Contract #1140 - Food Service Equipment

$7,725 &
Plexus Company DBA Culinex YIY|Y|Y|Y|[N]|N 498,400.00 $16,175* 498,400.00
Boelter LLC Y Y[Y|Y|Y|Y]|Y 502,825.00 NA 502,825.00 NA NA NA 1,005,650.00 NA NA NA NA NA NA
TriMark Hockenbergs Y[Y|Y|Y|Y|[N|N 536,697.00 NA NA NA NA NA 536,697.00 NA NA NA NA NA NA

Contract #1166 - Gymnasium Equipment

Contract #1235 - Laboratory Equipment/Furnishings/Casework

H2I Group, Inc.

64,237.00 64,237.00

Innovative Laboratory Systems

Contract #1420 - Elevators

Y|Y|]Y|Y[Y|N]|N 62,000.00 62,000.00 NA

Contract #2100 - Fire Protection

Nasseff Mechanical

Y|IY|Y|Y[Y[N]|N 940,000.00 940,000.00

Summit Fire Protection

Pioneer Power, Inc.

1,375,000.00 1,375,000.00

YIY[Y[Y]Y]Y]Y 4,297,000.00 NA NA NA NA NA 4,297,000.00 NA NA NA NA NA NA

NAC Mechanical and Electrical Services

Y[Y|[Y[Y|]Y|[N|N 5,035,700.00 NA NA NA NA NA 5,035,700.00 NA NA NA NA NA NA




AMERICAN INDIAN
MAGNET SCHOOL
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Saint Paul Public Schools - American Indian Magnet School
Bid Tabulation - March 26, 2020

Bid Bond
RCV Att A-1

Add 1
Add 2
Add 3
Add 4
RCV

Contractor Name Base Bid Alt 1 Alt 2 Alt 3 Alt 4 Alt 5 Total Bid

Contract #2300 - HVAC and Automation

Thelen Heating & Roofing, Inc. 2,998,000.00 (5,000.00)] 2,993,000.00

NAC Mechanical and Electrical Services Y|Y|Y|[Y|Y|N|N 3,510,100.00 NA 3,510,100.00

Contract #2600 - Electrical and Technology

Master Electric, Inc.

Y[Y|[Y|[Y|Y|[N|N

4,350,000.00

No Bid

4,350,000.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

2,875.00

NAC Mechanical and Electrical Services

Contract #3100 - Earthwork

4,485,000.00

(65,000.00)

4,420,000.00

NA

NA

NA

NA

1,500.00

Veit & Company, Inc. YIY|Y[Y]Y]Y]Y 870,600.00 5,350.00 NA NA NA NA 875,950.00 NA NA NA NA NA NA
US SiteWork, Inc. YIY[Y[Y]Y]Y]Y 959,900.00 5,340.00 965,240.00
G. Urban Companies, Inc. NIN[NIN|Y|[Y]Y 1,940,000.00 20,000.00 1,960,000.00

Contract #3210 - Exterior Paving

G. Urban Companies, Inc.

512,000.00

5,000.00

517,000.00

McNamara Contracting, Inc.

568,250.00

3,000.00

571,250.00

Contract #3300 - Utilities

Peterson Companies, Inc. Y[Y|Y|Y|Y|Y]Y 396,800.00 396,800.00
Hoffman and McNamara Co. Y|Y|Y[Y|Y|N|N 422,900.00 - 422,900.00 - - - - - -
Great Northern Landscapes, Inc. Y|Y|Y|Y|Y|[N|N 425,733.00 NA NA NA NA NA 425,733.00 NA NA NA NA NA NA
Prescription Landscape, Inc. Y| Y|Y|Y[Y[Y]|Y 618,000.00 NA NA NA NA NA 618,000.00 NA NA NA NA NA NA
G. Urban Companies, Inc. YIY|Y|Y|]Y|Y]Y 759,000.00 8,000.00 767,000.00

St. Paul Utilities and Excavating, Inc.

887,000.00

NA

NA

NA

NA

NA

887,000.00

NA

NA

NA

NA

NA

NA




— Saint Paul Public Schools - American Indian Magnet School
“ Bid Tabulation - March 26, 2020

AMERICAN INDIAN
MAGNET SCHOOL

Bid Bond
RCV Att A-1

Add 1
Add 2
Add 3
Add 4
RCV

Contractor Name Base Bid Alt 1 Alt 2 Alt 3 Alt 4 Alt 5 Total Bid

Combined Bids

Urban Companies - 3100 3210 3290 Y|Y|Y|Y|Y|Y]|Y 3,191,000.00 3,191,000.00




